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MAGNUS PHARMACEUTICALS 

CJC-1295 DAC 
2mg CJC-1295 DAC (VIAL) 


Read all of this leaflet carefully before you start taking this medicine because it contains 
important information for you. 

• Keep this leaflet. You may need to read it again.

• If you have any further questions, ask your doctor, pharmacist or nurse.

• This medicine has been prescribed for you only. Do not pass it on to others. It may harm them, 

even if their signs of illness are the same as yours.

• If you get any side effects, talk to your doctor, pharmacist or nurse. This includes any possible 

side effects not listed in this leaflet.


About 
CJC-1295 is a synthetic growth hormone secretagogue. It specifically belongs to the growth 
hormone releasing hormone (GHRH) family of drugs. These compounds all mimic the effects of 
endogenous GHRH, a 44-amino acid hypothalamic peptide hormone that stimulates the release 
of growth hormone from the pituitary gland. CJC-1295 is actually a very long acting GHRH 
analog. Whereas native GHRH has a half-life measured in minutes, which reduces its practicality 
as a therapeutic agent, CJC-1295 is capable of sustained increases in growth hormone and IGF-1 
with as little as once per week administration. This drug is used in the fitness community for the 
support of muscle growth and fat loss, as well as its potential anti-aging properties.


As mentioned, CJC-1295 is a slow acting GHRH analog. Its half-life ranges from 8-10 days in 
humans. This is due to its high affinity for compartmentalizing with serum albumin, a binding 
protein. About 90% of injected CJC-1295 winds up bound to albumin, which acts as a distribution 
vehicle. It provides a slow release of hormone back into free circulation over several weeks. The 
slow activity of CJC-1295 is reflected in its pharmacokinetic profile. One human study found a 
single injection (30,60,125, or 250 mcg/kg) to elevate serum growth hormone 2 to 10 fold for up to 
6 days. Serum IGF-I levels also rose by 1.5 to 3 fold in this same study, which persisted for up to 
2 weeks.


CJC-1295 does not significantly influence peak levels of GH or IGF-I. It also does not appear to 
influence the number of GH/IGF-1 peak episodes per day (GH is released in pulses, usually 8-10 
daily). These measures all remain stable during therapy. We note this is a second study, where 
researchers did reported a nearly 50% increase in total GH and IGF-1 secretion after 
administration of 60-90 mcg/kg. Looking very closely at the timing and levels though, they found 
the increase was in basal secretion.That is, the lows or "trough levels" of hormone that occur in-
between GH pulses. With CJC-1295, your "low periods" are significantly higher.


GHRH and ghrelin are the two primary positive regulators of growth hormone secretion in 
humans. These two hormones are the core focus of drugs of the GHRH and GHRP class, 
respectively. It is of note that GHRH analogs tend to display more specificity for growth hormone 
release than GHRPs.That is because endogenous GHRH has less activity in other areas as 
compared to ghrelin, which seems to influence a more diverse set of systems. Studies examining 
the pharmacodynamics of CJC-1295 confirm this. They find it has no acute effect on cortisol, 
prolactin, LH (luteinizing hormone), or TSH (thyroid stimulating hormone). Thus, we consider 
CJC-1295 a "selective" GH secretagogue, with a low likelihood of spillover side effects.


Note: The research designation for this compound is CJC-1295. Its structure includes a drug 
affinity complex (DAC). Likewise, referring to this as "CJC-1295 with DAC" is incorrect. All 
CJC-1295 has DAC. CJC-1295 without DAC is the drug Mod GRF 1-29.
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Warning 
CJC-1295 is an unapproved new drug. A thorough understanding of its safety and propensity for 
side effects in humans is lacking at this time.


This drug should never be used during pregnancy, with cancer, a history of cancer, diabetic 
retinopathy, sclerosing diseases of the liver or lungs, intracranial hypertension, or uncontrolled 
diabetes.


Side Effects 
Common side effects to CJC-1295 include flushing, warmth, dizziness, and transient hypotension 
following injection. Other common side effects include headache, diarrhea, nausea, and 
abdominal pain. Many side effects are dose dependent. In studies this drug appeared to be 
especially well tolerated at doses of 30 and 60 mcg/kg, while more significant side effects were 
noted with 125 and 250 mcg/kg doses. Also frequently reported are adverse effects typically 
associated with other types of growth hormone therapy, such as water retention (edema), joint 
pain (arthralgias), carpal tunnel syndrome, and numbness or tingling in the extremities. Note that 
the incidence of GFI-related side effects tends to be lower with GHRP therapy as compared to 
traditional hGFl.This is because GH/IGF-1 release is subject to the limits of endogenous 
synthesis, and as such the drug is less amenable to overdosing.


The subcutaneous administration of this drug may cause redness, itching, pain, or lumps at the 
site of injection. Injection site reactions occurred in approximately 70% of subjects receiving 
CJC-1295 by subcutaneous injection in one study.


This drug may impair glucose tolerance and raise blood sugar levels,. This may occur in 
individuals without preexisting diabetes or impaired glucose tolerance.


Administration 
CJC-1295 may be given by subcutaneous or intramuscular injection, or IV infusion. The 
subcutaneous route is most often applied.


This drug has not been approved for use in humans. Prescribing guidelines are unavailable.

When used for physique- or performance-enhancing purposes, CJC-1295 is generally 
administered at a dosage of 1000-2000 meg (1-2 mg). This is given 1-2 times per week. Cycles 
usually last 3-4 months, though programs of 6 months or longer are not uncommon. During 
investigatory studies with this drug, significant antibody formation (which might reduce the 
effectiveness of CJC-1295) was not reported. This suggests that desensitization is not likely to be 
rapid, if it does occur.


During clinical studies, CJC-1295 seemed to exert its optimal effect (tolerance, benefits) at a 
dosage of 30-60 mcg/kg. This was administered once every 7 or 14 days. The calculated amount 
would be roughly 2.5 to 5 mg for someone weighing 85 kg, which is similar to the common 
cumulative dosage range of CJC-1295 in the fitness community. Higher doses (up to 250 mcg/kg 
or 20 mg total for someone weighing 85 kg) were also well tolerated in studies, but with a higher 
incidence of side effects.



